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12VR
Voltage Power Convertors

Power control modules ensure 
compatibility of access hardware 
components and simplify system 
installation and troubleshooting. 
Modules may be ordered with or 
without power supplies. Different 
modules may be specified for one 
power supply.

Modules may be ordered with or 
without power supplies. Different 
function modules may be used in the 
same power supply or cabinet. 

SDC’s 12VR series used in 
conjunction with SDC’s 600 series 
power supplies set at 24 VDC for 
locking devices and components, 
provides a separate 12 VDC , 1 Amp 
output for 12 VDC access controllers, 
readers or other devices. The need for 
a separate power supply for 12 VDC 
and 24 VDC requirements within the 
same system is eliminated. 

•	 1 Amp @ 12 VDC (max)

•	 Powers access controllers, readers 
or other devices @ 12 VDC

•	 Two individually fused outputs

MODEL LIST $

12VR Voltage Power Convertor  78.00
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